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Respiratory Medicine in general
practice: what is the role 

of the pulmonary specialist?
M. Lusuardi

Aside from their specific topic, two papers in
the present issue of the journal [1, 2] can be also
viewed as a topical contribution to the debate on
the role of the General Practitioner (GP) and the
level of interaction between the GP and the Pul-
monary Specialist that is expected to achieve cor-
rect management of respiratory patients in prima-
ry care.

The results of the two studies differ largely in
their outcome. The article on pneumonia [1] con-
cludes that in Italy, management of community
acquired pneumonia (CAP) by GPs is effective,
and only in severe cases referral to the specialist
or hospital is really necessary. Obviously, differ-
ent steps are still in need of significant improve-
ment, such as prompt access to radiology and lab-
oratory. About 40% of patients received a diagno-
sis of CAP based only on clinical data having had
no chest X-ray, but the outcome of CAP was not
influenced by the performance of a chest X-ray. It
is interesting to note from the literature that radi-
ographic features of acute infection do seem to in-
fluence the management of lower respiratory tract
infections in the community [3], but the different
settings of the two studies do not allow a compar-
ison of results. Fortunately, the empirical antibiot-
ic treatment of CAP was effective in most cases,
avoiding a large number of hospital admissions
(only 8.5% of all patients needed hospitalisation
for worsening of the clinical picture, with a figure
of about 14% in patients of ≥ 65 years of age, co-
morbidities and monotherapy). Interestingly,
about 64% of all patients reported at least one
concomitant chronic disease as a risk factor. The
paper is descriptive and it is therefore not possible
to have comparison data between different antibi-
otic regimens. The first choice agents of Italian
GPs are quite different from those recommended
by most guidelines: parenteral 3rd generation
cephalosporins represented the most used antibi-
otics (more than 50% of patients, alone or in com-
bination). Further prospective studies would be
needed to evaluate whether the peculiar prescrip-

tion habits of Italian GPs have a significant influ-
ence on the high rate of success in domiciliary
treatment of CAP. In addition, despite the present
high success rate of empirical management,
prospective studies are needed on the impact of
instrumental diagnosis on CAP management and
outcomes in general practice.

On the contrary, the article on chronic obstruc-
tive pulmonary disease (COPD) [2] is somewhat
disappointing in concluding that spirometry is not
yet a common standard for diagnosis, despite large
accreditation of guidelines, such as GOLD [4] or
ERS/ATS guidelines [5], also by GPs’ scientific
societies. Discrepancies between guideline recom-
mendations and COPD management in general
practice have been underlined by several surveys
in different European countries [6-8].

There is a general agreement that spirometry
must be implemented because of the large under-
diagnosis of COPD at present and of the epidemio-
logical trend alerting physicians and health author-
ities that this is merely the tip of the iceberg [4, 5].

What is the gap between implementation of
guidelines and their current application? The
problems may be set at three different levels: cul-
tural (e.g. graduate and post-graduate education),
organizational, and economical. The first level is
one causing the most worry, since according to G.
Caramori’s study 30% of Italian GPs think that
spirometry is not necessary to diagnose COPD
[2]. It is not known whether this figure is decreas-
ing following the numerous CME (continuous
medical education) meetings on COPD guidelines
held all over Italy in the latest years, mainly spon-
sored by drug companies and held by Pulmonolo-
gists. It is suspected that guidelines written and
presented by specialists, reflect a compromise
among specialists and does not take many GPs’
problems into account. Therefore, although scien-
tifically correct and eventually agreed on by all
parties (which does not seem to be the case re-
garding spirometry for 30% of Italian GPs), their
implementation may prove very difficult. It is
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well known that there is an important gap between
evidence, as integrated and reported by guide-
lines, and clinical practice, particularly in primary
care [9]. In my experience, there is in some cases
a misunderstanding that asthma or COPD can be
treated in the same way with a combination (may
be a very practical fixed combination) of inhaled
corticosteroids and long-acting beta-2-agonists,
therefore respiratory function does not add much
to management criteria. This is obviously an error,
because many patients are at risk of over or under-
treatment, in particular if we think that asthma or
COPD management is not only drug therapy and
drug treatment per se may be not the same in the
different stages of severity [4, 5].

Secondly, referral to specialist facilities is of-
ten problematic dissuading GPs from requesting a
spirometry [2]. Office spirometry, as an alterna-
tive, is being supported by many specialist centres
in different countries, but results have been up to
now inconsistent according to the different experi-
mental setting. In general, all studies agree that of-
fice spirometry is feasible [10, 11], but studies on
a large scale show contradictory results in the reg-
ular application of spirometry by GPs [12, 13] as
compared to studies on a small number of general
practices and strict control of technical variables
and quality control [14, 15]. The experience in
Italy on large numbers of general practices is dis-
appointing, as stated by G. Caramori et al. com-
menting on the VEMS project that was terminated
before conclusion [2]. On the same line, another
large study, the SPACE (office spirometry in asth-
ma and COPD, a comparative evaluation) involv-
ing 570 GPs all over Italy confirmed the feasibili-
ty of office spirometry. However it also demon-
strated great difficulties in routine application and
limited impact on daily practice in the diagnosis of
asthma and COPD as compared to conventional
evaluation of patients, including case history sup-
ported by a detailed questionnaire and physical ex-
amination [16]. Nevertheless, it should be noted
that studies with negative results are not necessar-
ily negative due to the advancing of knowledge
and the implementation of good clinical practice:
the VEMS and SPACE studies may mean that of-
fice spirometry, if carried out in the way they have
been up to now in Italy (i.e. giving the spirometer
to the individual GPs and expecting him/her to
perform and interpret as many spirometries as pos-
sible, may be in every smoker, or performing the
test and transmitting data to a specialist for inter-
pretation) is bound to fail. As a matter of fact, the
individual GP is overwhelmed by clinical and bu-
reaucratic commitments, and spirometry is not like
passive instrumental tests such as EKG: it requires
time to explain the procedure to the patient and is
highly cooperation-dependent; it must be per-
formed at least three times in order to select the
best flow/volume loop; interpretation of the test
can be automatically supported by some devices,
but either way it requires a certain degree of expe-
rience. In fact, it is not the ideal type of instru-
mental test for most single Italian GPs at the mo-
ment, but the data in literature and the new plans

for re-organising general practice in Italy show us
a way with a greater likelihood of success. A vast
general practice held by a number of GPs with dif-
ferent areas of medical interest working together,
one or two of them in charge of respiratory evalu-
ations, a nurse or a technician supporting all the in-
strumental diagnostics of the practice, including
spirometry; finally, a close connection with a ref-
erence specialistic centre for referral of difficult
cases and quality control.

Last but not least, strictly connected to the or-
ganisation of spirometry services in general prac-
tice are the economical issues. In Italy, office
spirometry is not yet reimbursed by the National
Health Service, in contrast with other countries,
such as UK, where the test is regularly reimbursed
and GPs work in group with the support of techni-
cal personnel.

In conclusion, a great need for close interaction
and partnership between GPs and Pulmonologists
emerges strongly. Agreement on guidelines and
their dissemination must not be unidirectional (GPs
must be invited to contribute to the development of
guidelines from the beginning, and post-graduate
education must be planned by GPs and Pulmonolo-
gist cooperatively). In each geographic area appli-
cation of international guidelines must be translat-
ed into the specific regional context by GPs and
specialists in a collaborative way, adapting practi-
cal implementation to the organizing and economi-
cal peculiarities of the local health system. Special-
istic facilities must be available more promptly
(e.g. chest x-ray or laboratory for CAP and spirom-
etry for COPD or asthma), and whenever possible
conditions must be ensured to be applied directly in
a practical and reliable manner to general practice
through instrumental diagnostics such as the case
for spirometry in asthma and COPD. A good
premise is the increasing involvement of Pulmo-
nologists’ and GPs’ scientific societies in common
projects and meetings (see as an example the close
link between the European Respiratory Primary
Care Conference and the European Respiratory So-
ciety Annual meeting 2004 last September in Glas-
gow); the same is for different scientific societies in
Italy. We are all aware that the distance towards a
true partnership between GPs and Pulmonologists
for the standard management of respiratory pa-
tients, in particular those requiring long-term care,
such as in chronic obstructive disorders, is quite
long, but I am confident that we are moving (slow-
ly) in the right direction.
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